
Joliet Junior College
Bid for Printing Non Credit Catalog Fall 2014
4/10/2014

Quantity Description Total Printing 
Cost

Delivery Costs to 
Joliet Post Office

Delivery Costs to Other 
Post Offices per drop

Total Cost Total Printing 
Cost

Delivery Costs to 
Joliet Post Office

Delivery Costs to Other 
Post Offices per drop

Total Cost Total Printing 
Cost

Delivery Costs to 
Joliet Post Office

Delivery Costs to Other 
Post Offices per drop

Total Cost

226,000 8" x 10.5" approx. finish (16 x 10.5 flat) 52 inside 
pages plus cover.

$31,823.00 $0.00 $0.00 $31,823.00 $32,975.00 $1,100.00 $2,400.00 $36,475.00 $34,416.33 $5,038.42 $100.00 $39,554.75

Cost to add 1000 additional copies for 52 pages 
plus cover

$126.00 $150.00 $141.05

Optional:
48 inside pages plus cover $29,485.00 $0.00 $0.00 $29,485.00 $30,525.00 $1,100.00 $2,400.00 $34,025.00 $32,164.79 $5,038.42 $100.00 $37,303.21
56 inside pages plus cover $33,321.00 $0.00 $0.00 $33,321.00 $34,750.00 $1,100.00 $2,400.00 $38,250.00 $35,208.85 $5,038.42 $100.00 $40,347.27
60 inside pages plus cover $34,213.00 $0.00 $0.00 $34,213.00 $39,850.00 $1,100.00 $2,400.00 $43,350.00 $36,968.40 $5,038.42 $100.00 $42,106.82
64 inside pages plus cover $35,469.00 $0.00 $0.00 $35,469.00 $37,675.00 $1,100.00 $2,400.00 $41,175.00 $38,240.33 $5,038.42 $100.00 $43,378.75

Cost to add 1000 additional copies
48 + cover $120.00 $140.00 $131.82
56 + cover $132.00 $160.00 $145.16
60 + cover $137.00 $170.00 $152.42
64+ cover $142.00 $180.00 $158.51

Additional Notes: 

Certification of Contract Bidder
References
Sample similar work

Woodward Printing Services Intermountain Color DBA Signature Offset

Fall 2014

NPC, Inc.

YES
YES
YES

YES
YES
NO

YES
YES
YES



Joliet Junior College
Bid for Printing Non Credit Catalog Fall 2014
4/10/2014

Quantity Description

226,000 8" x 10.5" approx. finish (16 x 10.5 flat) 52 inside 
pages plus cover.

Cost to add 1000 additional copies for 52 pages 
plus cover
Optional:
48 inside pages plus cover
56 inside pages plus cover
60 inside pages plus cover
64 inside pages plus cover

Cost to add 1000 additional copies
48 + cover
56 + cover
60 + cover
64+ cover

Additional Notes: 

Certification of Contract Bidder
References
Sample similar work

Fall 2014

Total Printing 
Cost

Delivery Costs to 
Joliet Post Office

Delivery Costs to Other 
Post Offices per drop

Total Cost Total Printing 
Cost

Delivery Costs to 
Joliet Post Office

Delivery Costs to Other 
Post Offices per drop

Total Cost

$35,211.00 $0.00 No bid* $35,211.00 $31,400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $31,400.00

$181.00 $140.00

$32,628.00 $0.00 No bid* $32,628.00 $29,535.00 $0.00 $0.00 $29,535.00
$36,426.00 $0.00 No bid* $36,426.00 $32,755.00 $0.00 $0.00 $32,755.00
$37,630.00 No bid* $37,630.00 $34,105.00 $0.00 $0.00 $34,105.00
$38,790.00 No bid* $38,790.00 $35,451.00 $0.00 $0.00 $35,451.00

No bid*

$155.00 $130.00
$195.00 $145.00
$221.00 $150.00
$233.00 $160.00
*See bid for information for Periodical-Second Class Mail information

Castle PrintechLiberty Press

YES
YES YES

YESYES

YES


	CCC SP14  SM14

